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Objectives  

Lines of Action  In-charge  

 
1. To assure ownership and 
involvement of IUS at 
Provincial level  
 

 
1.1. Bring IUS and IUS-EAO 
documents, policies and 
programs to the level of the 
Provincial and his Council.  
 

IUS-EAO Coordinator  
IUS members in every 
institution  

 
2. To institutionalize processes 
in our IUS’s  
 

 
2.1. Work on making an 
Institutional Project for each 
IUS and share existing studies 
and institutional projects made  
2.2. Monitoring of the progress 
of the Institutional Project  
 

Management Team for each 
IUS in coordination with 
Provincial and Youth Ministry 
Delegate of the Province  
IUS-EAO Coordinator  

 
3. To initiate exchange 
programs among IUS in EAO  
 

 
3.1. Short Course on Solar 
Energy by Salesio  
3.2. Extend student exchange 
programs made by Salesio with 
other IUS.  
 

Salesio, Tokyo  
Salesio, Tokyo with IUS-EAO 
Coordinator  

 


